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(Handwritten date of Monday, July 6, 1936)  

MENINGITIS CLAIMS CHILD 

John Charles Idlewine, 1, Dies at Home Last Night  

   John Charles Idlewine, aged 1, (cut)..  at 11 o'clock Sunday evening. The child had been ill about four 
days.  The sickness was at first diagnosed as influenza and developed into meningitis. 

   The lad was born June 12, 1935, a son of Harold and Nellie Bixler Idlewine. 

   Surviving are the parents and a two-year-old sister.  The grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. John Bixler and 
Charles Idlewine, also survive. 

   The funeral will be at 1:30 Wed. afternoon at the home, Rev. Curts officiating.  Burial will be at Linn 
Grove.  

***** 
(Handwritten:  Wed., June 17, 1936)  

FUNERAL FRIDAY  

   Funeral services for Miss Rhoda E. Rediger, aged 17, who died Tuesday afternoon of bronchial influenza 
at the home of her mother, Mrs. B. E. Rediger, 4122 Buell Drive, will be held Friday afternoon at 1:30 
o'clock at the residence and at 2 o'clock in the Fort Wayne Gospel Temple.  The Rev. Clifford Hollifield 
will officiate. 

   Miss Rediger, daughter of the late Rev. B. E. Rediger, founder of the Fort Wayne Gospel Temple, had 
been ill for about a month.  Her father died at four years ago and her mother is now president of the Fort 
Wayne Gospel Temple Corporation. 

   Miss Rediger was an accomplished student of the piano, and was a member of the Girls' Glee Club at the 
temple.  She sang many times over the radio in a duet combination with Miss Harriett Rader.  She was a 
pupil at South Side High School. 

   The body was taken to the Carl H. Hauck Funeral Home and was to be (cut)...residence late this (cut)... 

    ... and Arvilla, both at home;  grandparents, J. E. Rich, of this city, and Jacob Rediger, of Chenoa, 
Ill.;  and a great-grandmother, Mrs. M. Fry, of Flanagan, Ill.  

***** 

(Handwritten:  Thursday, July 9, 1936)  

YOUNG COUPLE WED TONIGHT 



Miss Esther Schrock To Become Bride of Frank Mazelin  

   Miss Esther Schrock, daughter of (cut) miles north of town, will become the bride of Franklin C. Mazelin 
in a ceremony to be performed at the home of the bride's mother this evening.  Rev. Jacob J. Schwartz will 
officiate. 

   Mr. Mazelin is a son of Mr. and Mrs. David F. Mazelin of northwest of Berne, and is a prominent young 
farmer. 

   The couple will reside with the groom's parents for the present.  

***** 
 
(Handwritten:  Thursday, July 9, 1936)  

SAM SCHWARTZ RETURNS AFTER MISSING ONE DAY  

   Sam K. Schwartz, tenant on the Andrew Gottschalk farm east of town, who was reported missing 
Tuesday, appeared on the ?? streets today.  He said he never left the community.  He mowed weeds in 
town Tuesday and put ?? team in a barn here, then disappeared.  His wife and children are staying at the 
home of John Amstutz, having left their home ...Gottschalk farm, but Mr. Gottschalk is looking for another 
tenant, it is understood.  

***** 

(Handwritten:  Thursday, June 4, 1936)  

FORMER BERNE TEACHER WED 

Miss Ruth Armstrong Is Bride of Morton Ellis  

   ...science teacher and elementary grade music teacher in the Berne school for the past school season, was 
married to Morton Ellis on the afternoon of Memorial Day at the home of her father, T. T. Armstrong, at 
Logansport.  

***** 

 (Handwritten:  Thursday, June 4, 1936)  

NEW ARRIVALS 

   A daughter, Virginia Lee, was born to Ellison and Elfrieda Habegger Neuenschwander, Tuesday.  

   Jason and Esther Smith Gerig of Fort Wayne, are the parents of a son born at the Lutheran Hospital last 
week.  Mrs. Gerig is a daughter of the late Rev. Byron G. Smith, and (cut off) 

Adams County Historical Museum 1936 Scrapbook, image 63 

Transcribed by Karin King 


